RESOLUTION NO. 3848-0911

A RESOLUTION OF THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF PRESCOTT,
YAVAPAI COUNTY, ARIZONA, ADOPTING THOSE CERTAIN DOCUMENTS
ENTITLED THE “2006 INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE,”
AS ADOPTED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL, INC., AND THAT CERTAIN
DOUMENT ENTITLED “CITY OF PRESCOTT 2008 AMENDMENTS TO THE 2006
INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE” AS A PUBLIC RECORD,
AND DIRECTING THE CITY CLERK TO RETAIN THREE COPIES THEREOF ON FILE

RECITALS:

WHEREAS, the City of Prescott wishes to adopt that certain document entitied the
“2006 Intemational Wildland-Urban Interface Code” as adopted by the International Code
Council, Inc., as a public record, and

WHEREAS, the City of Prescott wishes to adopt that certain document entitled
“City of Prescott 2008 Amendments to the 2006 International Wildland-Urban Interface
Code”, Exhibit A attached hereto and made a part hereof, as a public record.

ENACTMENTS:

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
PRESCOTT AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1.  THAT certain document entitled the “2006 International Wildlanad-
Urban Interface Code” as adopted by the International Code Council, Inc., is hereby
declared to be a public record.

Section2. THAT certain document entitled the “City of Prescott 2008
Amendments to the 2006 Intemational Wildland-Urban Interface Code,” Exhibit A
attached hereto and made a part hereof, is hereby declared to be a public record.

Section 3.  THAT the City Clerk is hereby directed to maintain three (3) copies of
the above referenced public documents on file at all times for inspection by the public.

PASSEDAND ADOPTED by the Mayor and Council of the City of Prescott this 23"

day of September, 2008.
\‘
bt P ‘

JAEK D. WILSON, Mayor




RESOLUTION NO. 3848-0911 PAGE 2

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

, //':) 7 //
/J/yh’/%//n/(/l

~“GARY D. KIDD,/Z4fy Aftorney So

A. BURK

City Clerk



RESOLUTION NO. 3848-0911 PAGE 3

EXHIBIT ‘A’

CITY OF PRESCOTT 2008 AMENDMENTS TO THE
2006 INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE

Section 101.1 entitled “Administration; General; Title” is hereby amended to read
as follows:

“101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Wildland-Urban Interface
Code of the City of Prescott, hereinafter referred to as “this code”."

Section 101.2 entitled “Administration; General; Scope" is hereby amended to
read as follows:

“101.2 Scope. The provisions of this Code shall apply to any new construction
or the moving of any building, structures or premises into or within the Wildland-
Urban interface areas of the City of Prescott. This area is designated on the City
of Prescott Wildland-Urban Interface Vegetation Management Map as
referenced in and as Appendix “B-1" of this Code.

Exceptions:

1. Remodeling or additions, including but not limited to, decks of existing
buildings or structures are exempt.

2. Modular / manufactured buildings affixed on an individual lot are

exempted from the construction requirements of this code but are required
to comply with the vegetation requirements.

3. Any commercial, multi-family, townhouse, or triplex and larger resource,
including but not limited to, buildings, structures, landscapes, streetscape
features or sites may be exempted from this code if, it is determined by
the Building Official or Community Development Director, and approved
by the Fire Chief, that the exemption of said resource will not create an
additional fire hazard in the immediate vicinity of the resource.

4. Any cultural resources, including but not limited to, buildings, structures,
landscapes, streetscape features or sites may be exempted from this
code fif,

(a) it is listed in or officially determined eligible for, the National, State
of Arizona or City of Prescott Register of Historic Places or is
located within a Historic Preservation District and

(b) it is determined by the City of Prescott Historic Preservation
Specialist or the Community Development Director, and approved
by the Fire Chief, that the exemption of said resource will not



RESOLUTION NO. 3848-0911 PAGE 4

(C)

(F)

(G)

create an additional fire hazard in the immediate vicinity of the
resource.”

5. Any area designated by the City of Prescott to be riparian providing that
the exemption of said resource will not create an additional fire hazard in
the immediate vicinity of the resource.

The first paragraph of Section 101.3 entitled "Administration; General; Objective"
is hereby amended to read as follows:

"101.3 Objective. The objective of this Code is to establish minimum
regulations consistent with nationally recognized good practice for the
safeguarding of life and property. Regulations in this Code are intended to
mitigate the risk to life and structures from intrusion of fire from wildland fire
exposures and fire exposures from adjacent structures and to mitigate structure
fires from spreading to wildland fuels. A tiered level approach may be applied,
commensurate with the relative level of hazard present, under special
circumstances when approved by the Fire Code Official."

Section 105.2 entitled "Administration; Permits; Permits required" is hereby
amended by deleting the third paragraph therein and the fourteen subsections
thereunder, and to replace said paragraph with the following new paragraph, to
read as follows:

"105.2 Permits Required. Permits are required in accordance with Sec. 105.6
of the International Fire Code.”

ltem 1 of Section 105.3 entitled "Administration; Permits; Work exempt from
permit” is hereby amended to read as follows:

"105.3 Work exempt from permit.

1. One-story detached accessory buildings used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 200
square feet and the structure is located more than thirty (30) feet from the
nearest adjacent structure."

Section 105.8 entitled "Administration; Permits; Expiration" is hereby amended to
read as follows:

"105.8 Expiration. Every permit issued or extended by the code official under
the provisions of this code shall expire as set forth in said permit.”

Section 106.3 entitled "Administration; Plans and Specifications; Site Plan" is
hereby amended by adding the following sentence at the end of said section:

"Additional information may be required to be submitted on the site plan by the
code official."



RESOLUTION NO. 3848-0911 PAGE 5

(H)

(1)

(K)

Section 106.4 entitled "Administration; Plans and Specifications; Vegetation
Management Plans" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"106.4 Vegetation Management Plans. Vegetation management plans shall be
prepared and shall be submitted to the code official for review and approval as
part of the plans required for a permit. See Appendix B."

Section 202 entitled “Definitions; Definitions” is hereby amended by changing the
definition of “Driveway", to read as follows:

DRIVEWAY. A vehicle ingress and egress route that serves no more than two
buildings or structures, not including accessory structures, or more than two
dwelling units.

Section 202 entitled “Definitions; Definitions” is hereby amended by adding the
following definitions: “Aerial Fuel”, “Forest Floor”, “Heavy Timber Construction”,
“‘Ladder Fuel’, and “Surface Fuel”.

‘AERIAL FUEL shall mean all live and dead vegetation in the forest canopy or
above surface fuels, including but not limited to tree branches, twigs and cones,
snags, and high brush.

FOREST FLOOR shall mean fresh and decomposing organic litter which forms
the surface layer of a soil under forest vegetation

HEAVY TIMBER CONSTRUCTION (HT) as defined by the International Building
Code is classified as Type IV construction. HT beams/girders shall be not less
than 6 inch nominal in width and not less than 10 inch nominal in depth.
Post/columns shall be not less than 8 inches nominal, in any dimension when
supporting floor loads.

LADDER FUEL shall mean flammable materials occurring between surface fuels
and aerial fuels which act as a ladder to facilitate the spread of a surface fire to
tree crowns, or a crown fire down to the surface.

SURFACE FUEL shall mean loose surface litter on the soil surface to include
grasses, shrubs and tree seedlings available to burn.”

Section 302.1 entitled “Wildland-Urban Interface Areas; Wildland-Urban
Interface Area Designations; Declaration” is hereby amended to read as follows:

“302.1 Declaration. The Prescott City Council hereby declares the Wildland-
Urban interface area within the City limits as shown in Appendix B-1. The
Wildland-Urban interface area is based on the findings of fact as follows:



RESOLUTION NO. 3848-0911 PAGE 6

The seasonal climatic conditions during the late spring and early summer create
numerous serious difficulties regarding the control of and protection against fires
in the City of Prescott.

Average Maximum temperatures of 88.9 degrees in July
Relative Humidity: 10 to 15% in May and June
28 days of extreme fire weather conditions from end of April through July

Live Fuel Moisture in Chaparral from 61.8% in April to 86.4% in August.
(Anything under 80% will burn)

Fuel moisture in 1000 hour fuels is 5%
Winds: 35 to 40 MPH
Numerous dry lightning strikes.

Prescott has predominately fuel model 4 (Chaparral) which is found in, or
exposing, all of the “at risk neighborhoods”. This includes Oak brush (scrub oak)
and Manzanita.

Utilizing fuel model 4 scenarios as an example, the rate of spread could be 721’
per minute. The flame lengths could be 57’ high. Burning brands can spot
ahead of the fire for a distance of 2.1 miles, and ignite additional fires. The fire
could consume 5,641 acres in one hour and spread a distance of 8.1 miles. The
perimeter of the fire would be 90,321 feet. This type of fire is uncontrollable by
the on duty fire forces due to lack of staffing and lengthy response times. This
fire could result in a major structural conflagration. The fire could spread across
the Prescott Basin at the interface.”

Section 302.2 entitled “Wildland-Urban Interface Areas; Wildland-Urban
Interface Area Designations; Mapping” is hereby amended to read as follows:

"302.2 Mapping. The Wildland-Urban interface areas are defined as high-risk
areas designated on the Prescott Urban Wildland Interface Vegetation
Management Map as referenced in Appendix B-1."

Section 302.3 entitled "Wildland-Urban Interface Areas; Wildland-Urban
Interface Area Designations; Review of Wildland-Urban Interface Areas" is
hereby amended to read as follows:

“302.3 Review of Wildland-Urban Interface Areas. The Code official shall
reevaluate and recommend modifications to the Wildland-Urban areas in
accordance with Section 302.1 as frequently as deemed necessary by the Fire
Chief or the City Council.”



RESOLUTION NO. 3848-0911 PAGE 7

(N)

(0)

(P)

(Q

(R)

Section 402.1.2 entitled "Wildland-Urban Interface Area Requirements;
Applicability; Subdivisions; Water supply" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"402.1.2 Water supply. New subdivisions and other residential developments
as determined by this jurisdiction shall be provided with water supply in
accordance with Section 404 and in accordance with the International Fire Code.
Structures shall have a water hose bib installed to accommodate the use of a
garden hose on the exterior of each side of all dwelling units.”

Section 402.2.2 entitled " entitled "Wildland-Urban Interface Area Requirements;
Applicability; Individual Structures; Water Supply" is hereby amended to read as
follows:

“402.2.2 Water Supply. Individual structures hereafter constructed or relocated
into or within Wildland-Urban interface areas shall be provided with a conforming
water supply in accordance with Section 404, and in accordance with the
International Fire Code. Structures shall have a water hose bib installed to
accommodate the use of a garden hose on the exterior of each side of all
dwelling units.

Exception: Buildings containing only private garages, carports, sheds and
agricultural buildings with a floor area of not more than 600 square feet."

The second paragraph of Section 403.2 entitled "Wildland-Urban Interface Area
Requirements; Access; Driveways" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"403.2 Driveways. A driveway shall not serve in excess of two dwelling units."
[The exception remains]

Section 403.7 entitled "Wildland-Urban Interface Area Requirements; Access;
Grade" is hereby amended to read as follows:

“403.7 Grade. When a grade is approved in excess of 12% on a fire
department vehicle access roadway, fire sprinkler protection is required to be
installed in accordance with Section 903 of the fire code. Any grades of 12% or
greater shall not be permitted without the approval of the City Council.”

Exceptions 1 and 2 to Section 501.1 entitled “Special Building Construction
Regulations; General; Scope” are hereby amended to read as follows:

“Exceptions:

1. Accessory structures not exceeding 200 SQ. FT. (18.58 m2) in floor area
when located at least 30 feet from buildings containing habitable spaces.

2. Agricultural buildings at least 30 feet from buildings containing habitable
spaces."”



RESOLUTION NO. 3848-0911 PAGE 8

(S)

Section 502.2 entitled "Special Building Construction Regulations; Fire Hazard
Severity; Fire hazard severity reduction” is hereby amended to read as follows:

"502.2 Fire hazard severity reduction. The application of this section may be
used only when approved by the Code Official. When the Code Official has
determined that special circumstances exist and all other alternatives have been
exhausted, the Code Official may consider the application of this section as an
alternative to comply with the intent of the code. The fire hazard severity of
building sites for all buildings hereafter constructed, modified or relocated into
Wildland-Urban Interface areas shall be established in accordance with Table
502.1. See also Appendix C."

Section 503.1 entitled "Special Building Construction Regulations; Ignition-
Resistant Construction; General" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"Section 503.1 General. Building and structures hereafter constructed,
modified or relocated into or within Wildland-Urban Interface areas shall meet
the construction requirements in accordance with Section 504.

Table 503.1 entitled "Ignition-Resistant Construction, may be applied when
approved to do so by the Code Official, and shall be in accordance with Sections
505 and 506."

Section 504.2 entitled “Special Building Construction Regulations; Ignition-
Resistant Construction; Roof Covering” is hereby amended by adding an
exception to read as follows:

“Exception: Santa Fe style flat roofs"

Section 504.3 entitled "Special Building Construction Regulations; Ignition-
Resistant Construction; Protection of Eaves" is hereby amended by adding a
new paragraph at the end thereof, to read as follows:

“Soffits may be protected by use of 5/8-inch re-sawn plywood or an equivalent.
Open eaves are allowed when constructed of heavy timber."

Section 504.5 entitled "Special Building Construction Regulations; Ignition-
Resistant Construction; Exterior Walls" is hereby amended by adding two new
paragraphs at the end thereof, to read as follows:

“Exterior walls constructed of ignition resistant materials such as cement plaster
(veneer one-coat stucco), fiber cement board or other masonry products, as
approved by the code official, are allowed and acceptable.

Where wood siding of any type is used, there shall be required a ten (10) foot
clearing of all vegetation and a ten (10) foot minimum setback to all property
lines.”



RESOLUTION NO. 3848-0911 PAGE 9

(X)

(2)

Section 504.7 entitled “Special Building Construction Regulations; Ignition-
Resistant Construction; Appendages and Projections” is hereby amended to
read as follows:

"504.7 Appendages and Projections. Unenclosed accessory structures
attached to buildings with habitable spaces and projections, such as decks, the
structural support members (post, beams), of said structures and other
appendages, shall be a minimum of one-hour-rated fire-resistive construction,
heavy timber construction, in accordance with the International Building Code
(IBC), or constructed of approved noncombustible materials. Any under floor
space 24 inches or less from the bottom of a floor joist to the ground shall be
required to be a patio with a stem wall and a solid floor constructed of
noncombustible material.”

Section 504.8 entitled "Special Building Construction Regulations; Ignition-
Resistant Construction; Exterior Glazing" is hereby amended to read as follows:

“504.8 Exterior Glazing. Exterior windows, window walls, glazed panels and
glazed doors must have a 20-minute fire rating or adhere to the following criteria:
Glass must be of double pane or laminate construction. Single pane materials
are prohibited. Acrylic block windows are prohibited. Skylights must be
constructed of insulated tempered or heat strengthened laminate glass. Solar
tube sky lights must have a maximum exposed plastic lens no larger than sixteen
(16) inches in diameter and be used in conjunction with a class “A” roof.

Vinyl frame window assemblies are acceptable and must comply with the
following:

1. Frame and sash are comprised of vinyl material with welded corners, and

2. Metal reinforcement in the interlock area, and

3 Frame and sash profiles are certified in American Architectural
Manufacturers Association (AAMA) Lineal Certification Program (verified
with either an AAMA product label or Certified Products Directory) and

4. Certified and labeled to ANSI / AAMA / NWWDA 101/1.8.2-97 for
structural requirements, and

5. Glazed with insulating glass, annealed or tempered glass.”

Section 504.9 entitled “Special Building Construction Regulations; Ignition-
Resistant Construction; Exterior Doors” is hereby amended to read as follows:

“504.9 Exterior Doors. Exterior doors shall be solid-core wood not less than 1
%-inches (45mm) thick, or doors shall have a minimum 20-minute fire rating or
comply with the following criteria: Doors to have a minimum 1 %-inch (45 mm)
thick stile and rail. Wood doors to have a minimum panel thickness of %-inch
measured at center of panel. Alternate door materials include 1/16-inch or larger
fiberglass composite or Masonite skin when used with a laminate, hardwood, or



RESOLUTION NO. 3848-0911 PAGE 10

(BB)

(CC)

composite interior perimeter core and a 1 %-inch stile and rail. Metal doors must
have a minimum 26-gauge skin.

Doors with glass within the door must have minimum double glazed tempered or
tempered laminate glass bound in fiberglass, composite or wood frame and have
a minimum stile and rail thickness of 1 %-inches. Windows within doors and
glazed doors shall be in accordance with requirements of section 504.8.

Exception: Vehicle Access Doors.”

Section 504.10 entitled "Special Building Construction Regulations; Ignition-
Resistant Construction; Vents" is hereby amended to read as follows:

“504.10 Vents. Attic ventilation openings, foundation or under-floor vents, or
other ventilation openings in vertical exterior walls and vents through roofs shall
be covered (inside or outside) with noncombustible, corrosion-resistant mesh
with openings not to exceed 1/8 inch (3.2mm).

Attic ventilation openings in soffits, eave overhangs, between rafters at eaves or
in other overhang areas shall be allowed. These vent openings are required to
be located as close to the fascia as is possible. Such ventilation openings shall
be covered (inside or outside) with a noncombustible, corrosion resistant mesh
with openings not to exceed 1/8 inch (3.2mm)."

Section 504.11 entitled "Special Building Construction Regulations; Ignition-
Resistant Construction; Detached accessory structures" is hereby amended to
read as follows:

“504.11 Detached accessory structures. Detached accessory structures
located less than thirty (30) feet from a building containing habitable space shall
have exterior walls constructed with materials approved for a minimum of one-
hour-rated fire-resistive construction, heavy timber, log wall construction, or
constructed with approved noncombustible materials on the exterior side.

The area below the structure shall have all under-floor areas enclosed with
exterior wall construction in accordance with Section 504.5 or under-floor
protection in accordance with Section 504.6.

See Section 504.2 for roof requirements."

Section 602 entitled "Fire Protection Requirements; Automatic Fire Sprinkler
Systems" is hereby amended to read as follows:

“SECTION 602
AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS

602.1 General. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in
all occupancies in new buildings as required by the fire and building codes. The






